
Comprehensive Planning Committee


September 26, 2007

COMPREHENSIVE PLANNING COMMITTEE
The Comprehensive Planning Committee of the City of Raleigh met in regular session on Wednesday, September 26, 2007, at 8:00 a.m. in the City Council Chamber, Raleigh Municipal Building, 222 West Hargett Street, Avery C. Upchurch Government Complex, Raleigh, North Carolina, with the following present:

Committee






Staff
Chairman Thomas G. Crowder, Presiding

Deputy City Attorney Ira Botvinick

Tommy Craven




Planning Director Mitch Silver

Joyce Kekas





Development Regulations Senior Planner

Russ Stephenson




     Greg Hallam







Assistant City Manager – Operations Dan

     Howe
Chairman Crowder telephoned to say he would be late due to car trouble.  Mr. Stephenson called the meeting to order at 8:11 a.m. and asked everyone to stand for a moment of silence.

Item #03-14 – Downtown Master Developer Process
Periodic reports are made to the Committee by administration about progress in developing the City’s property around the new convention center site and the southern part of Fayetteville Street.
Ms. Kekas arrived at 8:14 a.m.

Assistant City Manager Dan Howe highlighted current active projects in the strategic plan.  The original plan was to take the City's assets in the south end and craft a plan around that for future growth with the primary goal to spur private investment to complement public investment.  Construction of the parking structure on Site 1 should begin after the first of the year.  The underground parking structure should be completed by the end of next year, with the opening of the driveway to Wilmington Street to allow access to the 500+ spaces in the Phase 1 parking deck.  The developer will continue construction with the two towers on that site, and already has major tenants close to signing.  Retail space is more active than first thought when this project began.  The City is grateful for the tax base that will result from this project.  There will be approximately $130 million in private improvements on the site, which currently has a zero tax value.  The final figure is estimated to be $125 million to $150 million when the project is completed.

On Site 4, located immediately in front of the Performing Arts Center parking deck on Salisbury Street, Empire Properties will build a boutique hotel.  Staff anticipates submission of a site plan by the end of the week.  There is already some activity on that site, as well as on the parking lots on Sites 2 and 3.  The activity is related to the City's utilization of the EPA ground fields revolving loan fund to remove underground storage tanks to prepare those sites for future development.  The loan funds are amortized over 10 years at a very low interest rate.  Removal of the tanks allows Empire Properties to move forward on Site 4, and it is hoped that construction will begin in April or May of 2008.  This will likely be a $50 million program on that site, which currently has a zero tax value.  Development of Sites 2 and 3 will be considered at a later date, probably when all the other construction is underway.

Two additional City-owned sites, Sites 5 and 6, are part of this plan.  Site 5 is a triangular wedge of land located between Dawson and McDowell Streets, south of South Street, bisected by a railroad overpass.  The plan consultants considered this the least developable parcel of City-owned land in that area and at this time there are no plans for developing it.  There is a lot of activity on the west end of the City.  Cherokee Partners is developing Triangle Transit Authority-related property there.  The City is conducting a study for an intermodal center and its future in the western part of downtown south.  The City is waiting to see what happens with two of the subjects of the cultural/convention district plan, namely, the development of the South Street parcel and redevelopment of the Davie Street corridor.  Davie Street is a major connector from Fayetteville Street to the developing western part of the downtown area.  Site 6 is the City-owned site at Martin Luther King, Jr. Boulevard and Salisbury Street.  It is a large block and has been identified as a potential site for a combination of commercial and rental residential uses.  At this time, the City is not making active efforts to market that property.

Phase 1 of Fayetteville Street is complete.  It is anticipated that the October 16 City Council meeting packets will contain information regarding Fayetteville Street Phase 2 from the Plaza south to Lenoir Street, including the connector between Fayetteville Street and the Convention Center on Salisbury Street in front of the hotel porte cocheres.  The City has contractual obligations to the hotel developer to have the street completed by the time the hotel opens in mid-2008.

The City Plaza/Fayetteville Street 2 project has been split into two pieces.  When they were bid as one project, the bid numbers came in high.  Additionally, the owner of the Hannover Square parking deck on the Plaza site was not moving with the same sense of urgency as the City for the easement agreement amendment necessary to allow City construction crews on the site.  Their engineers are still looking at the City's plans, which they have had since June, and staff has given them a deadline for providing additional comments.  City staff hopes to provide the Council members with information regarding the City Plaza project by late fall.  Staff also believes that by bidding these projects separately, bids may be received from smaller contractors, which will help increase the competition.  However, there will be inefficiencies by constructing in two projects. 

Chairman Crowder arrived at 8:26 a.m.

Ms. Kekas asked if the City had the necessary signed documents providing authority to go through the City Plaza.  Mr. Howe replied not until the property owner, the Simpson Organization, signs the revised easement agreement.  The original easement agreement with the Hannover Square developer did not include vehicular access for that site.  The Simpson Organization understands the value of this, but is being conservative about its parking deck asset to make sure it is not damaged or otherwise degraded in value.  The City cannot do anything until the revised easement agreement is signed.  Mr. Howe said the Plaza will probably not be open in time for the grand opening of the new Convention Center.

Mr. Howe said significant progress has been made on the remainder of the cultural/convention district plan as well.  The Downtown Parking Task Force will study parking downtown.  The downtown housing market study has been completed.  A public arts strategy for downtown is on the "to do" list.  Staff has no plans to move ahead with that right now, but the Arts Commission may be interested in undertaking the project.  The Planning Department will work on a pedestrian improvement plan as part of the Comprehensive Plan Update.  Mr. Howe said he mentioned earlier that Davie Street redevelopment is tied to the Cherokee Partners development.  The cultural/convention district plan included a recommendation that Lenoir and South Streets be made two-way streets.  Plans have been approved for that project, a bid package will be brought to the City Council in November, and the conversion will be completed in time for the hotel opening next fall.  Another plan recommendation involved the Martin Luther King, Jr. Boulevard intersection, with possible roundabouts, but that has not progressed.  There is not much constituency support for that improvement, so it remains in the plan but is not being considered at this time.

Mr. Howe concluded by stating he is pleased at how much has been accomplished so far within the framework and recommendations of the plan.  The City's overall objective is to move the public infrastructure plan forward to the point where the City is generating private tax base as a result of its major investments in public sector projects, and it seems to be playing out so far.

Mr. Stephenson asked about the potential for additional development on the Progress Energy site.  Mr. Howe replied it was discussed as part of the cultural/convention district plan.  Illustrations show an L-shaped arrangement with a structure coming out of the ground in front to create a major public space with Lichton Plaza in the middle.  It generated some discussion but the plan contains no recommendations about it, and there are no active plans for that right now.  The site would have to be developed very sensitively because of the architecture of the building behind Progress Energy.

Chairman Crowder stated he would like to remove this item and carry it over to the new 2007-2009 City Council.  Without objection, it was agreed to follow that recommendation.

Item #03-29 – Development Standards – Fragile Neighborhoods

This issue arose from the review of a controversial subdivision (S-91-03) administratively approved in the King Charles neighborhood for duplex development within a deteriorating area. The item was last discussed on April 11, 2007.  That was prior to the Planning Department’s report to the Council on April 17 when Council discussed prioritization of text changes and the Department’s work program.  Subsequently, Council authorized an additional position in the Planning Department to focus on the issues of infill development.
Chairman Crowder said his intent was to carry this over to the new City Council so it can be included with the discussions of infill development.  Without objection, it was agreed to follow that recommendation.

Item #03-78 – TC-10-04 – Front Yard Parking for Single Family and Duplex Dwellings

Item #03-79 – TC-10-05 – Surfacing Requirements of Existing Front Yard Parking for Single Family Detached and Duplex Dwellings

This issue was first raised through citizen concerns over the increasing number of vehicles being parked in front yards in parts of the City, and the resulting negative impacts on neighborhood appearance.  The Appearance Commission took an active lead on this issue and working with City legal staff, drafted an ordinance TC-10-04, which proposes to amend the City Code to further limit the impact of parking within the front yard and corner side yard area of single family and duplex dwellings and to require parking spaces and driveways to be surfaced and delineated.  The ordinance went to public hearing in May of 2004.  

The recommendations put forth by the Appearance Commission were further refined by the Planning Commission and referred to the City Council for approval in 2005.  During the review of TC-10-04 by the Planning Commission, additional needs were identified which led to the development of a supplemental text change proposal, designated TC-10-05.  This ordinance would additionally address “two-attached” (duplex) townhomes, create retrofitting requirements for existing parking areas, and institute a permit fee for driveway construction.  To date, TC-10-05 has not gone to public hearing.  These issues were last discussed by the Committee on September 12, 2007.
Senior Planner Greg Hallam distributed copies of the text changes recommended by the Planning Commission.  Chairman Crowder said he had hoped to continue discussion of the proposal he presented at the September 12 Committee meeting.  He received comments from constituents that 40% paving in the front yard is too much and that rather than looking at a sliding scale, there should be certain definitive rights.  His proposal was an attempt to include a guaranteed drive plus an additional 300 square feet of paved area as long as it did not exceed 40%.

John Brooks, 516 North Blount Street, Raleigh, NC  27604-1120 – Mr. Brooks stated he had not seen Chairman Crowder's proposal, and he would like to study it.  His general comment is that in looking all over Raleigh, it still appears the effect of these two considerations will have the result of driving a lot of poor and middle-class people out of downtown, especially on the east side.  He knows people think they are preparing for the major urbanization of downtown, but he said one could drive out New Bern Avenue and see the very costly effect of complying with these proposals.  Mr. Brooks said these proposals are perfect examples of over-regulation.  The Council needs to think of people’s freedom and the use of their properties.  Let the regular market and development process take care of this problem, he said.

Chairman Crowder said he gets calls every day from people whose neighborhoods are turning into parking lots.  The purpose of this is to prevent the paving of an entire front yard, which is being done by a lot of rental properties and is part of what is causing neighborhoods to be turned into parking lots.  It is increasing stormwater runoff in many instances and the market is driving this problem.

Parking issues and proposals were discussed briefly.  Planning Director Mitch Silver said from the last meeting, there was no clear direction for staff to move forward, so they have done no additional work on this issue.  Chairman Crowder's proposal would not address pre-existing situations, which is the bulk of concerns that have been brought forward.  There had been discussion of home ownership versus rental properties, and how to split the text change to address specifically where it is more problematic in rental situations.  To move forward with that proposal, it will be necessary to do some test cases in all situations.  The three issues to address are parking and regulation of impervious surface, soil compaction, and enforcement.

Chairman Crowder suggested this item be removed and carried over to the 2007-2009 City Council.  Mr. Botvinick pointed out TC-10-04 was proposed in 2004, has gone through public hearing, and was recommended for approval by the Planning Commission.  He noted that subparagraph (a) in Section 3 has a step schedule addressing combined parking and driveway areas (1) within the first 30 feet of right-of-way, and (2) between 30 to 60 feet of the right-of-way.

Ms. Kekas moved to recommend the City Council not adopt TC-10-04, but keep the subject in Committee to be addressed by the 2007-2009 City Council.

Mr. Brooks said Raleigh Historic Districts Commission approved a plan for the redevelopment of Blount Street, and the plan calls for opening alleys through the existing blocks.  Townhouses, apartments and carriage houses built on those would face those carriage ways, which are considered private streets.  He asked if "front yard" would apply to those situations, or if they were exempt.  The carriage houses will have no dirt around them and the front yards will be 100% paved.  He asked how they will be affected.  Chairman Crowder said the intent was to address parking on public streets having front yards, and this is kind of a hybrid.  He is not sure how it will be interpreted and said it would be addressed by the Planning Department.

Mr. Stephenson said front yard parking is a great concern in some neighborhoods and not at all a concern in others.  He seconded Ms. Kekas' motion.  Chairman Crowder called for the vote and the motion carried unanimously, 4-0.

Item #03-102 – Conservation Management for Ponds and Lakes

This item was referred to Committee to look at the possible use of ponds and lakes as conservation management methods.  It was last discussed by the Committee on October 25, 2006 when Stormwater Program Manager Danny Bowden and the Chair of the Stormwater Management Advisory Commission gave an update to the Committee.  The Committee retained this item on the agenda without further direction.
Chairman Crowder stated he would like to remove this item and carry it over to the new 2007-2009 City Council.  Without objection, it was agreed to follow that recommendation.

Item #05-42 – Sustainable Urban Landscapes and Hillsides
This item was referred to Committee to determine the possibility of developing a sustainable urban landscaping manual for the City.  The Planning Department has completed some preliminary analysis of other municipalities' manuals on "hillside preservation."

The general purpose of these steep slope regulations are to:
♦
Reduce hillside erosion and excessive stormwater runoff by conserving vegetation and protecting natural terrain;

♦
To preserve hillsides having unique aesthetic value and guide development in order to protect and enhance the natural features of such areas;

♦
Establish special protection for highly visible steep slope areas; and
♦
Promote stewardship ethic through improved administration, enforcement of hillside regulations, a public education campaign and public-private partnerships (conservation easements).
The general regulations associated with hillside preservation:

♦
Prohibit development on excessively steep slopes (i.e., greater than 40%);

♦
Contain special regulations for the development of steep slopes (i.e., slopes between 15% and 25% and slopes between 25% and 40%);

♦
Requires that detailed information be provided on steep slopes at the time of site plan review (i.e., soil conditions, vegetation);

♦
Provide density/intensity transfer incentives for preserving steep slopes;

♦
Require buffers adjacent to steep slope areas; and
♦
Post-construction treatment.

This item was last discussed on February 14, 2007.  The item was held in Committee to allow the Committee time to review the back-up information provided.
Chairman Crowder stated he would like to remove this item and carry it over to the new 2007-2009 City Council.  Without objection, it was agreed to follow that recommendation.

Item #05-46 – Text Change – Car Wash Facilities
In 2003, the City Council adopted conditional regulations for car washes proposing to locate within 100 feet of a residential use or zoning district.  During the review of a proposed car wash facility on Tryon Road, the Comprehensive Planning Committee felt that additional conditions were warranted for this use at that specific site.  The Committee initiated this item to study whether the existing City Code regulations should incorporate these or similar additional conditions, or increased spacing requirements between car washes and residential uses, which would be applicable to the entire zoning jurisdictional area.

The Committee has discussed this issue several times, with the most recent discussion on August 15, 2007.  At that time, the Committee directed staff to prepare a text change prohibiting new car washes within 200 feet of residential uses.

Mr. Hallam distributed copies of the proposed text change, and reviewed the document with the Committee:

Section 1.
Amend Sections 10-2041(b)(2), 10-2042(b)(2), 10-2043(b)(2), 10-2045(b)(2), 10-2046(b)(2) and 10-2047(b)(2), the listing of Conditional Uses, under the "Carwash facility located..." listing, by deleting the words "one hundred (100)" and substituting in lieu thereof the following: "two hundred (200)."

"Carwash facility located within one hundred (100) two hundred (200) feet from the property line of either any lot which is developed with a dwelling, congregate care or congregate living structure or vacant lot located in a residential zoning district.”

Section 2.
Amend the Section 10-2071, SCHEDULE FOR PERMITTED LAND USES IN ZONING DISTRICTS, COMMERCIAL category, within the first nested box of the "Carwash facility" land use listing, by deleting the words "one hundred (100)" and substituting in lieu thereof the following:  "two hundred (200)."

"Carwash facility located within one hundred (100) two hundred (200) feet from the property line of either any lot which is developed with a dwelling, congregate care or congregate living structure or vacant lot located in a residential zoning district."

Section 3.
Amend the Section 10-2072, Conditional Uses – Alphabetical Listing, by deleting the "Carwash facility located..." listing in its entirety and inserting in lieu thereof the following:
"Carwash facility located within two hundred (200) feet from the property line of either any lot which is developed with a dwelling, congregate care or congregate living structure or vacant lot located in a residential zoning district, as measured from the nearest point of the carwash facility and its associated accessory uses to the residential lot line.

Carwash facility located within one hundred (100) two hundred (200) feet from the property line of either any lot which is developed with a dwelling, congregate care or congregate living structure or vacant lot located in a residential zoning district, as measured from the nearest lot line to point of the carwash facility and its associated accessory uses to the residential lot line."

Section 4.
Amend Section 10-2072(b) by deleting the "Carwash facility located..." listing in its entirety and inserting in lieu thereof the following:
"Carwash facility located within one hundred (100) two hundred (200) feet from the property line of either any lot which is developed with a dwelling, congregate care or congregate living structure or any vacant lot located in a residential zoning district, as measured from the nearest lot line to point of the carwash facility and its associated accessory uses to the residential lot line."

Carwash facilities locating within one hundred (100) feet from the property line of either any lot which is developed with a dwelling (excepting the residence of a caretaker or watchman accessory to a permitted industrial use), congregate care or congregate living structure or any vacant lot located in a residential zoning district, as measured from the nearest lot line to lot line, shall meet all-of-the following:

(1)
Carwash facilities not fully staffed during all hours of operation (unless associated with and operating under the same hours of operation as a "staffed" automotive service and repair facility) and not located within either the Downtown Overlay District, a Planned Development Conditional Use Overlay District, a Shopping Center or Shopping Area shall be prohibited from locating within two hundred (200) feet from the property line of either any lot which is developed with a dwelling, congregate care or congregate living structure or any vacant lot located in a residential zoning district.

(2)
Carwash facilities fully staffed during all hours of operation or carwash facilities associated with and operating under the same hours of operation as a "staffed" automotive service and repair facility and locating within two hundred (200) feet from the property line of either any lot which is developed with a dwelling (excepting the residence of a caretaker or watchman accessory to a permitted industrial use), congregate care or congregate living structure or any vacant lot located in a residential zoning district, as measured from the nearest point of the carwash facility and its associated accessory uses to the residential lot line, shall meet subsections a. through e. below.
(3)
Carwash facilities not fully staffed during all hours of operation located within either the Downtown Overlay District, a Planned Development Conditional Use Overlay District, a Shopping Center or Shopping Area locating within two hundred (200) feet from the property line of either any lot which is developed with a dwelling (excepting the residence of a caretaker or watchman accessory to a permitted industrial use), congregate care or congregate living structure or any vacant lot located in a residential zoning district, all located outside of the Downtown Overlay District, the Planned Development Conditional Use Overlay District, the Shopping Center or the Shopping Area, as measured from the nearest point of the carwash facility and its associated accessory uses to the residential lot line, shall meet all of the following:
a.
All washing, waxing, machine drying and related activities and operations shall be conducted entirely within an enclosed building (except for vehicular openings a maximum of twelve (12) feet in width) with the exception of vacuuming, hand drying and hand waxing of vehicles, the sale of items from vending machines and refuse storage and disposal.  No vehicular openings providing access to the enclosed building shall face any adjacent property line containing a dwelling, congregate care or congregate living structure or vacant lot located in a residential zoning district.  For purposes of this section, the building wall providing access shall be at an angle greater than sixty (60) degrees from the residential property line.
b.
All vacuuming machines located outside of the enclosed building shall be of a design that does not exceed a noise level reading of forty-five (45) d/b/a, as measured from the property line, between the hour of 6:00 a.m. to 7:00 a.m. and fifty-five (55) d/b/a at all other lawful hours of operation.

Cross reference:  City noise regulations Part 12 Chapter 5.
c.
Operation of the establishment shall be prohibited prior to 6:00 a.m. or after 11:00 p.m. on all days of the week.  The hours of operation shall be required to be posted on site at a conspicuous location and vehicular access to any portion of the carwash facility shall be restricted during closed hours.
d.
If the carwash facility property is located immediately adjacent to the property line of either any lot which is developed with a dwelling, congregate care or congregate living structure or vacant lot located in a residential zoning district, the minimum width transitional protective yard required by §10-2082.9 shall not be reduced under any circumstances.
e.
The average street protective yard required by §10-2082.5 shall be the minimum width street protective yard required for the property.

If the cost of the rebuilding, reconstruction, repairing or restoration of a carwash facility not permitted to be located within one hundred (100) two hundred (200) feet from the property line of either any lot which is developed with a dwelling, congregate care or congregate living structure or any vacant lot located in a residential zoning district and existing prior to the adoption of these regulations* will be fifty (50) per cent or more of its county listed property tax value, the carwash facility shall not be rebuilt, reconstructed, restored, or operated except in compliance with these regulations.  However, the establishment of a dwelling, congregate care or congregate living structure within a nonresidential zoning district or the rezoning of a nonresidential zoning district to a residential zoning district occurring after the application of these regulations* and on property located within one hundred (100) two hundred (200) feet of an existing carwash facility shall not render the existing carwash facility as nonconforming.
*Editor's note:  This regulation first became applicable on August 10, 2003.  Ordinance No. (2003}490 – TC-238, TC-6-03.

Cross reference:  Renovation, maintenance and repair work which during any one calendar year exceeds fifteen (15) per cent of the Wake County listed tax value of any zoning nonconformity, §10-2146.3."
Mr. Craven asked if hand washing would be an appropriate addition to subparagraph 3(a) in Section 4 as an activity that would be allowed outside a building.  Brief discussion ensued regarding the definition of hand washing, and whether the hose and wand of a pressurized hand washer could be used outside if the compressor was housed in an enclosed building.  There was some question whether using the pressurized water hose and wand outside would meet the decibel levels.  Another issue pertaining to the decibel level was sporadic versus constant noise.  Mr. Botvinick commented that since no time frame for measuring is included in the text change, any time the 45 or 55 decibel limit is exceeded, the property is in violation.  He said 45 decibels is very low.

Lacy Reaves, Esq., Kennedy Covington, 4350 Lassiter at North Hills – Suite 300, Raleigh, NC  27609-5793 – Mr. Reaves said he was present with Charlie Bell, President of American Pride and spokesman for the car wash industry.  They commend staff’s efforts in the proposed text change.  Unfortunately, the document was not available until late yesterday, and they did not receive copies until this morning.  Mr. Reaves said there are several matters they would like to discuss with the Committee.  They want to draw these issues to the Committee's attention in writing and hopefully discuss them at the next meeting.  They request that the proposed text change be held to the next meeting.  Within the next several days they will complete their review and send correspondence by e-mail to staff, the Committee members and the City Attorney's office.  One concern he voiced is that there was discussion at the last Committee meeting about grandfathering certain existing facilities with regard to some of these provisions, but that is not in this draft.

Charlie Bell, 3408 Williamsborough Court, Raleigh, NC  27609-6367 – Mr. Bell said subparagraph (1) in Section 4 is not realistic.  For example, he said, the convenience store industry has changed over the years.  Most convenience stores are owned and operated by people of various nationalities, and many of those stores have car washes.  The store employees usually know very little about car washes.  The car wash is usually operated by someone in the car wash industry that the store has contracted with, and therefore cannot be considered "staffed."  With regard to the decibel levels in subparagraph 3(b) of Section 4, he said a bird chirping at night is 45 decibels.  Outdoor air conditioning units and road noise exceed that level, and are probably around 78 decibels.  Mr. Bell stated the grandfathering clause is hugely important for him, especially with regard to American Pride's Brier Creek facility.  He said there are always exceptions to every rule, and the grandfathering clause is important.

Chairman Crowder said there could be no blanket exceptions for special cases; that is what the Board of Adjustment is for.  Mr. Botvinick replied a Special Use Permit could be created for approval by the City Council.  The problem would be the inability of the neighbors to articulate detailed facts with points to be discussed.  There is no grandfathering clause included in this text change because they would already be grandfathered according to subparagraph 3(e) of Section 4.  In the City Code, there is grandfathering for nonconforming uses, and rebuilding after any destruction over 50% will require Board of Adjustment approval.  The applicant must prove to the Board of Adjustment that replacement of the nonconforming use will not have an adverse effect.  Mr. Botvinick stated it is illegal to create an exception for one particular use.  He suggested that most people protect themselves through insurance.  Mr. Bell said it would not be possible to protect oneself through insurance, because the insurance companies will not allow over-valuation and over-insurance of property.

This item will be held in Committee.

ADJOURNMENT
There being no further business before the Comprehensive Planning Committee, Chairman Crowder announced the meeting adjourned at 9:52 a.m.

Leslie H. Eldredge

Deputy City Clerk

PAGE  
12

